
PSP’s Value Statement 

 

At the Philadelphia School of Psychoanalysis (PSP), we are dedicated to fostering an 
inclusive and dynamic community grounded in the principles of psychoanalytic 
education, clinical practice, and social responsibility. Our core values guide us as we 
navigate the complexities of modern society and strive for excellence in all our 
endeavors: 

1. Commitment to Lifelong Learning: We believe in the continual personal and 
professional growth of our members, fostering an environment that encourages ongoing 
education, critical thinking, and intellectual curiosity. 

2. Diversity, Equity, and Inclusion: We value the richness that diverse perspectives bring 
to our community. We are committed to creating a climate of purposeful inclusion, 
addressing systemic inequalities, and promoting social justice across all facets of our 
organization. 

3. Professional Ethics and Integrity: We uphold the highest standards of ethical behavior 
and integrity in our clinical practices, research, and educational programs. Our 
commitment to professional ethics ensures that we serve our community with respect, 
transparency, and accountability. 

4. Collaborative Leadership: We believe in the power of collaborative leadership to drive 
innovation and excellence. By nurturing leadership skills across all levels of our 
organization, we empower individuals to take initiative, inspire others, and contribute to 
the collective success of our community. 

5. Community Engagement: We are dedicated to serving our local and global 
communities through accessible psychoanalytic services, telehealth and distance 
learning initiatives, and community partnerships. Our efforts aim to enhance mental 
health and well-being, particularly for underserved and marginalized populations. 

6. Innovation and Adaptability: In response to the evolving landscape of psychoanalysis 
and mental health, we embrace innovation and adaptability. Our commitment to 
expanding online education, telehealth services, and new programmatic offerings 
reflects our readiness to meet the emerging needs of our learners, clients, and the 
broader society. 

7. Support and Well-being: We prioritize the well-being of our professional community 
and clients. By fostering a supportive and compassionate environment, we ensure that 
everyone in our community feels valued, heard, and empowered to thrive. 



Together, these values shape our identity and drive our mission to develop and sustain 
a strong psychoanalytic community. We are dedicated to building a future where 
psychoanalysis continues to be a vital force in understanding the human mind, 
addressing social phenomena, and promoting mental health. 

 


